
 Rules of the Cont  est

• By agreeing to take part in  IAS JUNIORS, all the student participants, hereafter
referred to as ‘Participant/s’ and participating schools and its representatives hereafter
referred to as ‘School/s’ agree to be governed by the rules of the contest and the terms
of IAS JUNIORS.

•  There shall be no refund of the registration fee in case the participant wishes to opt
out at any stage or in case of a no show or under any other circumstances. 
IAS JUNIORS reserves the right to allow or disallow a participant from participating
in the contest. 
 
•  Under any circumstances, the registration is NOT transferrable. Only the registered
participant will be allowed to continue through the overall contest. 

•  All  the  information  entered  by  the  participating  school  while filling  in  the
application form will be verified by IAS JUNIORS, as necessary. If any discrepancy
is found thereof,  IAS JUNIORS reserves the right to disqualify such a participating
school at any stage of the contest without prior notice. 

• By registering for the  IAS JUNIORS ONLINE EXAM, participating school also
indicate their acceptance to receive communication that the organisers may send them
from time to time regarding the  IAS JUNIORS EXAM or other relevant product,
offerings or services.

•  IAS  JUNIORS reserves  the  right  to  modify  the  format,  schedule,  mode  of
assessment, prizes and any matter related to the IAS JUNIORS ONLINE EXAM.

•  Trophies,  Medals  and Certificates,  once  awarded to  the  participating  school,  as
applicable, will be final and there would be no exchange/substitution/replacement of
the awards. Awards and Certificates are non-transferable. 



•  If  the  specified  awards planned  to  be  given  becomes  unavailable  due  to  any
circumstance,  IAS  JUNIORS reserves  the  right  to  substitute  the  award with  an
equivalent one at their discretion. 

• Neither  IAS JUNIORS nor the sponsors/partners, or employees of  IAS JUNIORS
and/or sponsors/partners may be held liable for any warranty, costs, damage, injury,
or any other claims incurred by the recipient as a result of usage of the prize awarded
by IAS JUNIORS. 

• Participating Schools agree that they will photograph/film/record on behalf of IAS
JUNIORS during the award ceremony held in school.

•  IAS  JUNIORS request  schools  to  send  such  photograghs/videos  to
enquiry@iasjuniors.com  / WhatsApp 9791010636.

• The photos/recordings may be used in both printed and digital form, in various
channels.  The  images/recordings  will  be  used  in  gallery  section  of
www.iasjuniors.com . 

•  For  IAS  JUNIORS  EXAM,  Minimum  10  students  must  register  per  school.
Maximum There is no limit.

• Any clarification regarding rules, format/pattern of the exam, etc., may be sought

from us through WhatsApp - 9791010636 or through email enquiry@iasjuniors.com.

(Coordinator should be appointed by School)

•  IAS  JUNIORS  EXAM  should  be  conducted  in  the  respective  schools  of  the

participants during school hours.

• IAS JUNIORS Exam can be conducted either in school computers with internet

Connection or students can attend test in their  smartphones sitting in specific exam

room assigned by school.

• In unavoidable situation (Lockdown/Holidays), School can instruct students to be in
home and appear for the exam from the safety of their homes. 
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• IAS JUNIORS reserves the right to withdraw or terminate this contest at any time
without prior intimation. 

•  Participating Schools are requested to refrain from sharing any false / incorrect /
undesirable information about the contest on social media platforms. IAS JUNIORS
reserves the right to take disciplinary action if there is a violation to this point. 

•  Participating Schools of the IAS JUNIORS Online Olympiad Contest who violate
any rule, gain unfair advantage or use fraudulent means may be disqualified at any
time during the contest. 

• Decisions taken by IAS JUNIORS concerning all disputes shall be final and binding
on all participating schools.

Other Information - Communications 

• For all matters related to the contest, participating schools can communicate with
IAS JUNIORS via the support email (enquiry@iasjuniors.com)/WhatsApp number
(9791010636). These are also mentioned on the website www.iasjuniors.com 

•  Contact  details  like  Mobile  Numbers  of  the  Participants/Parents  (wherever
applicable) are mandatory and should be carefully and correctly entered in students
list to enable smooth sharing of important notifications and documents. 

• Schools will receive regular updates regarding their student participation and other
important communication during the course of the contest. 

http://www.iasjuniors.com/


Registration Of School – Step By Step Rules

1) Please Visit our website www.iasjuniors.com, Click REGISTER YOUR SCHOOL
Button

2)  Appoint School Coordinator To Conduct and Coordinate IAS JUNIORS Exam.

3)  School Principal  /  Coordinator  Will  Receive Username and Password Through
WhatsApp / E-Mail. 

3) Give Circular/Notification (WhatsApp Group Message/Website/ School Circular)
about IAS JUNIORS to students.

4) Prepare Enrolled Students List, Collect Fees From Students (Students List Must
Contain Student Name, Std, Parent’s Mobile Number)

5)  Visit  Our  Website  Again,  Using  Username  and  Password,  Login  and  Upload
Enrolled Students List (PDF/WORD Format), Click PAYMENT BUTTON and Pay
Total Fees (Rs.500 x Total Number Of Students).

6) Once We Receive Students List And Payment, Confirmation Message will be sent
to school.

7) IAS JUNIORS Free App will be shared to each and every enrolled students with
unique username and password.

8) Before IAS JUNIORS Exam, Various Notes Will Be Posted In App. Also, Practice
tests  (Mock Test)  will be conducted in  IAS JUNIORS App. Through Practice Tests
students will get trained with syllabus.

9)  On  Date  Slot  Chosen  By  School,  IAS  JUNIORS  ONLINE  EXAM  Will  Be
Conducted.

10) Schools Have The Choice To Conduct IAS  JUNIORS  EXAM Either Through
Our App Or Through School Computers With Internet Connection. 

Update
. Once All Names Typed,
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